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Appendix VI 

PROJECT DOCUMENT FOR NEW WORK ON THE NEW FORMAT TO CODEX STAN 234-1999  

RECOMMENDED METHODS OF ANALYSIS AND SAMPLING 

1. Purpose and scope of the proposed standard 

The purpose of the proposed new work is to amend CODEX STAN 234-1999 Recommended Methods of 
Analysis and Sampling to the normal format for a standard, including a preamble and other relevant 
information, scope and use of the Standard. 

2. Relevance and timeliness 

The methods of analysis listed in Codex standards are primarily intended as methods for the verification of 
provisions in Codex standards. In this context, it is critical to keep updating the methods of analysis in a 
single document or a single database, which would allow a simplified and effective search for method as well 
as a permanent and dynamic revision system. The CCMAS supported CODEX STAN 234 as a single 
reference for methods of analysis and proposed that CODEX STAN 234 be amended to the normal format 
for a standard, i.e. to include a preamble and other relevant information as to the scope and use of the 
Standard. The General Standard for Contaminants and Toxins in Food and Feed (CODEX STAN 193-1995) 
or the General Standard for Food Additives (CODEX STAN 192-1995) could be used as examples for the 
amendment. 

3. The main aspects to be covered 

A number of changes will be considered such as the inclusion of a preamble, scope and other relevant 
information to the use of the standard as well as establishing a new structure with a format that allows cross 
references with commodities standards. 

4. An assessment against the Criteria for the Establishment of Work Priorities 

General Criterion: Consumer protection from the view of health, food safety, ensuring fair practices 

in food trade and taking into account the identified needs of developing countries. 

The proposed work falls under the general criterion for establishment of work priorities, because the use of 
the Code will strengthen protection of consumers by ensuring food safety. This work also seeks to promote 
fair practices in food trade taking into account the identified needs of developing countries.  

The proposed work is directed primarily to provide a trusted source of information regarding methods of 
analysis in a single document or a single database, which would allow the verification of provisions in Codex 
standards. 

Criteria applicable to general subjects: 

 a) Diversification of national legislations and apparent resultant or potential impediments to international 

trade: 

It is covered by the preceding paragraph.  

b) Scope of work and establishment of priorities between the various sections of work: 

See above section on purpose and scope.  

c) Work already undertaken by other international organizations in this field and/or suggested by the relevant 
international intergovernmental body(ies):  

No other similar work has been undertaken by other international organizations.  

d) Amenability of the subject of the proposal to standardisation: 

It is amenable to standardization since the Codex Stan 234-1999 is already adopted, and the revisions will 
be simply to streamline information and make it readily available. Thus, there should be no problem with 
standardization.  

e) Consideration of the global magnitude of the problem or issue: 

It is covered by the preceding paragraph. 
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5. Relevance to Codex strategic objectives 

The proposed work falls under 3 Codex Strategic Goals:  

Strategic goal 1. Establish international food standards that address current and emerging food issues: the 
standard intents to verify the provisions in Codex standards. 

Strategic goal 2. Ensure the application of risk analysis principles in the development of Codex standards: 
this work will help in risk management activities, providing a single source of methods of analysis in case of 
dispute and for inspection and control program.  

Strategic goal 4. Implement effective and efficient work management system and practices: making readily 
available a single trusted source of Methods of Analysis.  

6. Information on the relation between the proposal and other existing Codex documents 

This standard will build on the Procedure Manual and the CODEX STAN 234-1999 Recommended Methods 
of Analysis and Sampling 

7. Identification of any requirement for and availability of expert scientific advice 

Additional scientific advice is not necessary at this moment.  

8. Identification of any need for technical input to the standard from external bodies so that this can 

be planned for 

There is no need for additional technical input from external bodies.  

9. Proposed timeline for completion of the new work, including the start date, the proposed date for 

adoption at Step 5, and the proposed date for adoption by the Commission; the timeframe for 

developing a standard should normally not exceed five years  

Work to start in 2018 with adoption at Step 5 and final adoption in 2020. 


